
The firm of Margaret Gettle 
Washburn, P.C. is a general 
trial practice dedicated to 
representing injured workers, 
accident victims, family law, 
criminal defense, business 
and corporate litigation, and 
estate probate matters in 
Lawrenceville. The attorneys 
and paralegals are team players, 
committed to great service for 
their clients. She is known for 
her trial advocacy over the past 
35 years in Gwinnett County. 
Attorney Houston Washburn is a 
member of the firm, specializing 
in personal injury cases and 
criminal defense. Attorney Scott 
Mitchell specializes in family 
law, estate and probate matters. 
Ms. Washburn graduated from 
Emory University School of 
Law. She is the Chief Judge, 
Municipal Court for the City 
of Sugar Hill; Associate Judge, 
Duluth, Berkeley Lake and 
Winder; recipient of numerous 
awards from Gwinnett County 
Bar Association and Council 
for Municipal Court Judges of 
Georgia; “Best of Gwinnett” 
for legal representation 
2014-present; Gwinnett People 
to Know; sponsor of Gwinnett 
Leadership of Women; Past 
President, GCBA, Lawrenceville 
Kiwanis Club and Council for 
Municipal Court Judges; over  
70 published articles. Member  
of Gwinnett Chamber of 
Commerce and the Georgia 
Bulldawg Nation!
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